Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB
Amanda McCracken

Account Clerk

Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD
May 7, 2021
ATTN REBECCA MILLER ATTN STAN DANZGER ATTN LISA DECASTRO
BOB BARKER COMPANY INC CHARM-TEX VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
7925 PURFOY ROAD 1618 CONEY ISLAND AVE 7025 INDUSTRIAL PART RD
FAQUAY VARINA NC 27526 BROOKLYN NY 11230 MOUNT PLEASANT TN 38474
BID #:21-12 NAME: INMATE APPAREL & SUPPLIES

CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY 1, 2021 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024
AWARD: AS PER HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS ON TABULATION
Dear Bidders:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid/RFP submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on
full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid/RFP.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
vV W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If youhave any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.
A
" Sincérely, |

( /
N {:y—»/

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Corcraft Products

SHARED/BIDS/b21-12INMATEAPPAREL&SUPPLIES/AWARD TEXT.DOCX



County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk

Mary Ann Shear

MAY 7, 2021

ATTN LLOYD HAMILTON
CORCRAFT PRODUCTS
550 BROADWAY
ALBANY NY 12204

NOTICE OF AWARD

BID #21-12 NAME: INMATE APPAREL & SUPPLIES

CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY 1, 2021 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2024

AWARD: AS PER HIGHLIGHTED ITEMS ON TABULATION

Dear Mr. Hamilton:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid/RFP submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on
full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid/RFP.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:
V Purchase Order - To be issued

If you hav/g2ﬂy-~questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

/

/

/. . .
etti, Purchasing Director

Mar){Sa
C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Bob Barker Company Inc., Charm-Tex, Victory Supply LLC

SHARED/BIDS/b21-12INMATEAPPAREL&SUPPLIES/AWARD TEXT.DOCX



JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPT., 195 ARSENAL STREET, WATERTOWN, NY 13601
Phone: (315)785-3077/ Fax: (315) 785-7591

JEFFERSON COUNTY VENDOR INFORMATION FORM

A. VENDOR INFORMATION
COMPLETE BUSINESS NAME: PARENT COMPANY:

(LEGAL NAME AS USED IN REPORTING TO IRS) (IF APPLICABLE)

MAILING ADDRESS: (For Purchase Orders)

STREET STREET:

CITY STATE ZIP CITY STATE ZIP
TELEPHONE #: TELEPHONE #:

(800 IF AVAILABLE): (800 IF AVAILABLE):

FAX#: REMITTANCE ADDRESS:

WEBSITE: STREET:

E-MAIL: CITY: STATE ZIP
TAXPAYER ID/SS#: (THIS IS MANDATORY)

(IF YOU DO NOT PROVIDE A VALID TIN/SS# ALL PAYMENTS TO YOU WILL BE SUBJECT TO 20% BACKUP WITHHOLDING.)
B. TYPE OF BUSINESS

CORPORATION SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP PARTNERSHIP DBA OTHER

NEW YORK STATE BUSINESS - CHECK ALL THAT APPLY
& SMALL BUSINESS
3 MINORITY OWNED AND REGISTERED WITH NEWYORK STATE

OUT OF STATE BUSINESS - (IF YES, CHECK ONE OF THE OPTIONS BELOW)
2 REGISTERED WITH THE NY DEPARTMENT OF STATE

O NOT REGISTERED WITH THE NY DEPARTMENT OF STATE

C. PURCHASE ORDER REQUIREMENTS

PURCHASE ORDERS WILL NOT BE MAILED, BUT WILL BE PROVIDED BY PHONE OR ELECTRONICALLY. HARD COPIES WILL BE
PROVIDED ONLY UPON SPECIFIC REQUEST.
__Itis our policy to require a hard copy of all Purchase Orders. If copies of Purchase Orders are required they will be forwarded by electronic
mail, fax or USPS at the County’s discretion.

D. TYPE OF GOODS/SERVICES PROVIDED

SUPPLIER OF GOODS: (Please List):

SERVICE PROVIDER (Please List - Medical, Legal, Rental, Consultant, Construction, Etc.):
E. PAYMENT METHOD

O Electronic funds transfer — The form to set up electronic payments can be accessed on the County website www.co.jefferson.ny.us under the
Treasurer’s Department, choose forms, vendor.

O Check
Return Form To: Jefferson County Purchasing Department, 195 Arsenal Street, Watertown, NY 13601
(315) 785-3077/ Fax: (315)785-7591
F. CERTIFICATION

[ CERTIFY THAT THE INFORMATION CONTAINED HEREIN (INCLUDING ALL PAGES ATTACHED) IS CORRECT AND THAT
NEITHER THE APPLICANT NOR ANY PERSON (OR CONCERN) IN ANY CONNECTION WITH THE APPLICANT AS A PRINCIPAL OR
OFFICE, SO FAR AS IS KNOWN, IS NOW DEBARRED OR OTHERWISE DECLARED INELIGIBLE BY ANY PUBLIC AGENCY FROM
BIDDING FOR FURNISHING MATERIALS, SUPPLIES, OR SERVICES TO ANY AGENCY THEREOF.

Signature of Person Authorized to Sign Application Name and Title of Person Signing Date
(Please Print)

-

SASHAREDWMISC DEPT FORMS\Vendor Letters & Forms\Venfor Form Updates 121515.doc



Form W-9 Request for Taxpayer - gi;': :;::' .Loof:gt
. December 201 .

it oo A ldentlﬁcation Number and Certiﬁcatlon send tb the IRS.

Intemal Revenuse Service g - e

-1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Nameis nsquired on this lins; do not leave this line blank.

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if‘differént from above

[ individual/sole proprietor or
single-member LLG

the tax classification of the slngle—member owner.
‘T other (see instructions) »

Print or type

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification; check only ahe of the followlng seven boxes
Oe Corporatlon [Os Corporation [ Pastnership

[] Limited liability company. Enter the tax classlﬂcatlon (C=C corporation, S=8 corgaration, P=partnership) >
Note, Fora slngle-member LLC thatis dlsmgarded do not check LLC; check the appropriate box in the line above for -

4 ermpﬁons codes ply only to
certain entlﬁes( lndlaﬁd.gals |zee
instructions on page 3): .

Exempt payee.code (if any)
Exemption from FATCA reporting.
code (if any}

Apples fo .
l’.

[ Trust/estate

wistde the U.S,)

5 Addres(nwnber straat,andapt.orsulte no)

Requester’s nams and address {optional)

8 City, state, and ZIP code

See Speclﬁc lnstructhns on page 2.

7 List account number(s} here (optional)

m Taxpayer Identification Number (TiN)

TIN on page 3.

Enter your TIN'in the appropnate ‘box. The TIN provided must match the name given on fine 1 toavoid - | Social security number
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a :
resident allen, sole propriefor, or disregarded entity, see the Part .instructions on page 3. For other - { |-
entities, it is your employer 1dentlﬁcatlon number (EIN) if you do not have a number, see How to gefa

or E
Note. If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1 and the charl: on page 4 for | Employer identification number
guxdelmes on whose number to enter. -

Certification

Under penaltles of perjury, 1 certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer lden’uﬁcatlon number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and

- 2. | am-not subject to backup withholding because. {a) t am exempt from backup withholding, or (b}-| have niot been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or [c) the IRS has notlﬂed me that | am

no longer subjectto backup wlthholdmg, and
3. tamaU.S. cmzen or other U.S. person (deﬁned below), and~

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (f any) Indi icating that | am exsmpt from FATCA reportlng is oorrect.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 ‘above if you have been notified by the IRS that yols are cufrently subject to backup wnthholdlng
becatse you have failed to report.all interest and dividerids on your tax rétum. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage
interest paid, acquisition or' abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and
generally, payments Gther than interest and dmdends you ‘are not requlred to sugn the cerﬁficatlon but you must provcde your correct TIN. See the

: lnstructlcns on page 3.
Sign | signature of ' S
Here | us.person»> . Date »
General 'nstructlons &Flgrm)losa (home mo:tgage interest), 1098-E (student Ioan interest), 1098-T
uition)
 Saction references dre to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise noted. e Form 1089-C (canceled debt)

Future developmems Information about developments aﬂ‘ectlng Form W-9 (such
as legisiation efmd after we release i) isatwww.lrs.gov/wa

‘_ Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-2 requ&stet) who is requlmd to f‘ le an information
retum with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN)
which may be your social sécurity number (SSN), indlvidual taxpayer identification
number (TIN), adoption taxpayer identification number {ATIN), or employer

s ldenﬁﬂcatlonnumber(ElN),bleportonanlnformaﬂon retum the amount paid to

you; or other amount reportable oh an information return. Examples of information
retums Include. but are not llmmed fo, the follow:ng . ]

o Farm 1099-INT (interest earned or paid) .
° Form 1098-DIV {dividends, including those from stocks or mutual funds)
< Form 1099-MISC (varlous types of income, prizes, awards, or gross proceeds)

‘© Forni 1098-B (stock of mutus} fund safes and certain other tramactlons by
‘brokers} -

-© Form 1099-S {proceeds from real esmte tmnsacﬁons)
* Form 1098-K {merchant card and th_lrd party network transactions)

o Form 1088-A (acquisition or- -abandonment of secured property)
Use FormWQonlynfyou areaUsS. pemn(includlng a resident allen),
provide your cofrect TiN.

IfyoudonotretumForm W-9 toﬂ)emquestarwltha TiN, younughtbe subject
to backt.p withholding. See What is backup wm‘rholdlng? on page 2

By slgning the filled-out form, you:
1. Ca‘llfythattmnNyouare gwlng is correct (oryou atewaiting fora number

~ tobe lssued)

2. Cemfy that you are not sub]ect to backup wlthholdhg,

3. Claim exemptlcm from backup- wllhholdlng if you are & U.S. exempt payee i§
applicable, youare also cértifying that as a U.S. person, your aflocable share of
any partnérship iricome from a-U.S. trade or business is not subject to the -
wrmholdlng tax on foreign p@tnsas share of effectively connected income, and

4. Cerﬁfy that FATCA codefs) enterad on this form §f any) lndlcating that you are

- exempt from the FATCA réporting, is correct. See What s s FATCA reportfng? on
. pags 2 for further mfomlatzon

~

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W-9 Rev. 12-2014)



BID #21-12

INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7112021 - 6/30/2022

7/1/2022 - 6/31/2023

MINIMUM

7112023 - 6/30/2024

|
MINIMUM MINIMUM | |
TEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. ESTIMATED ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED PRODUCT ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED PRODUCT ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED vV PRODUCT
ANNUAL QTY PRICE CODE PRICE CODE PRICE | CODE
QUANTITY | QUANTITY | QUANTITY | |
APPAREL ITEMS
SHOES, Black, Step In, Slip Resistant,
1 Stress Tear and Odor Resistant, 12/CASE 4 CASES
Waterproof, One Piece
1pair *SMALL  $3.05 ($36.60/CS) $146.40 FEVST35-BK-S 1 pair *SMALL $3.14 ($37.68/CS) $150.72 FEVST35-BK-S 1 pair *SMALL $3.23 ($38.76/CS) $155.04 FEVST35-BK-S
> : i *MEDI! " 6.60/C" 6. Fl -BK- i *MEDIUM i .68/CS . FEVST35-BK-M i *MEDIUM .23 ($38.76/CS 155.0. FEVST35-BK-M
BOB BARKER|  *Pricing based on 1 pair 1 pair EDIUM  $3.05 (33 ,o\ S) $146.40 EVST35-BK-M 1 pair MED! 4$3.14 ($37.68/CS) $150.72 35 :vm“_‘ $3.23 ($38.76/CS) $155.04 35:
1 pair *LARGE  $3.05 ($36.60/CS) $146.40 FEVST35-BK-L. 1 pair *LARGE $3.14 ($37.68/CS) $150.72 FEVST35-BK-L 1 pair *LARGE $3.23 ($38.76/CS) $155.04 FEVST35-BK-L.
1 pair *X-LARGE  $3.05 ($36.60/CS) $146.40 FEVST35-BK-XL 1 pair *X-LARGE $3.14 ($37.68/CS) $150.72 FEVST35-BK-XL 1 pair *X-LARGE  $3.23 ($38.76/CS) $155.04 FEVST35-BK-XL
SMALL ﬁ $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK SMALL $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK SMALL $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK
CHARM-TEX MEDIUM ﬁ $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK MEDIUM $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK MEDIUM $49.90 $199.60 m\mqmn,mx
LARGE 7 $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK LARGE $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK LARGE $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK i
X-LARGE i $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK X-LARGE $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK X-LARGE $49.90 $199.60 F/STEP-BK
case SMALL i $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case SMALL $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case SMALL $43.14 $172.56 SHEVDSB-(SZ)
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC. case MEDIUM i $41.88 $167.52 . SHEVDSB-(SZ) case MEDIUM $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case MEDIUM $43.14 $172.56 SHEVDSB-(SZ)
case LARGE 7 $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case LARGE $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case LARGE $43.14 $172.56 SHEVDSB-(SZ)
case X-LARGE 7 $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case X-LARGE $41.88 $167.52 SHEVDSB-(SZ) case X-LARGE $43.14 $172.56 SHEVDSB-(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
SHIRTS
Size: Medium to 8 XL |
Non-Binding V-Neck, Short Sleeves, |
Hemmed Sleeves and Bottom, One
2 Breast Pocket, 65% Polyester, 35% EA | 37 EACH
Cotton, Minimum Weight - 7.5 oz. |
JCCF to be imprinted w/ 3" White
Letters, Centered on back, |
Color: Orange & Solid Green W
|
TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE
. (green)/ . (green)/ - (green)/
1each M-Xlarge $5.35 $197.95 i 1each M-Xlarge 45.51 $203.87 Sl 1each M-Xlarge $5.67 $209.79 TOS-SIZE
(orange) (orange) (orange)
TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE
. (green)/ (green)/ . (green)/
1each 2XL - 4XL $5.81 $214.97 TossE 1each 2XL - 4XL $5.98 $22126 TOSSIZE 1each 2XL - 4XL $6.16 $227.92 oS sirE
. L (orange) (orange) (orange)
BOB BARKER| *Prici sed on 1 pair/ea
£ DEDaeCon D e TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE
. (green)/ . (green)/ . (green)/
1each 5XL- 6 XL $6.70 $247.90 TOS-SIZE 1each 5XL- 6 XL $6.90 $255.30 TOSSE 1each 5XL-6 XL $7.10 $262.70 hotipiiad
(orange) (orange) (orange)
TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE TGS-SIZE
B (green)/ R (green)/ . (green)/
1each 7XL- 8XL $7.25 $268.25 TOS-SI1ZE 1each 7XL - 8XL $7.47 $276.39 TOSSIZE 1each 7XL- 8XL $7.69 $284.53 TOS-SIZE
(orange) (orange) (orange)
M-Xlarge $6.18 ,$228.66 S M-Xlarge $6.18 $228.66 S M-Xlarge $6.18 $228.66 S
2XL - 4XL $6.54 $241.98 S 2XL - 4XL $6.; $241.98 S 2XL - 4XL $6.! $241.98 S
CHARM-TEX 51 9 4 54 41.9 4 54 41.9
5XL- 6 XL $6.90 $255.30 s 5XL - 6 XL $6.90 $255.30 s 5XL-6 XL $6.90 $255.30 s
7XL - 8XL $6.90 $255.30 S 7XL - 8XL $6.90 $255.30 S 7XL - 8XL $6.90 $255.30 S
each M-Xlarge $5.77 $213.49 UNSH-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $5.77 $213.49 UNSH-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $5.94 $219.78 UNSH-(SZ)
each 2XL - 4XL $5. $220.8 UNSH-(SZ. each 2XL - 4XL $5. $220.8 UNSH-(SZ each 2XL - 4XL $6.1 $227. UNSH-(SZ
i 5.97 9 (52) 4 5.97 9 (52) 4 5 7:55 (52)
each 5XL- 6 XL $6.31 $233.47 UNSH-(SZ) each 5XL- 6 XL $6.31 $233.47 UNSH-(SZ) each 5XL-6 XL $6.50 $240.50 UNSH-(SZ)

S:\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\Inmate Apparal & Supplies Ex 6-30-24\Inmate Apparel & Supplies B21-12 Exp 6-30-24\B21-12 TABULATION




BID #21-12

INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021 - 6/30/2022 7/1/2022 - 6/31/2023 71112023 - 6/30/2024
* ‘ M, ‘ _
MINIMUM MINIMUM | | MINIMUM
\TEM # DESCRIPTION —— ESTIMATED ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED PRODUCT ORDER | UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED | PRODUCT ORDER | UNIT PRICE PER PKG. EXTENDED , PRODUCT
ANNUAL QTY PRICE CODE PRICE CODE | PRICE | CODE
QUANTITY | | QUANTITY QUANTITY | |
each 7XL.- 8XL $6.31 $233.47 UNSH-(SZ) each _ 7KL - 8XL $6.31 $233.47 UNSH-(SZ) each _ 7XL- 8XL $6.50 $240.50 UNSHH(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
Pull-On Style, Elastic Waistband,
PAIR
B Mock Fly, Hemmed Bottoms, No 44PAIR
Pockets, 65% Polyester, 35% Cotton,
imum Weight - 7.5 oz.
Color: Orange & Solid Green
7 TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE | ToTsize
(green) (green) | (green)
M-XI B X - r B - X 5 |
1each arge $6.25 $275.00 TOT-SIZE 1each M-Xlarge $6.44 $283.36 TOTSIZE 1each M-Xlarge $6.63 $291.72 | Torsize
(orange) (orange) (orange)
TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE
(green) (green) (green)
- 6. 5 - 5 K o 6.1 .36
1each 2XL - 4XL $6.55 $288.20 TOTSIZE 1each 2XL - 4XL $6.75 $297.00 TOT-SIZE 1each 2XL - 4XL $6.94 $305.3 TOTSIZE
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair (orange) (orange) (orange) |
TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE
(green) | (green) (green)
XL-6 X X - 3 X XL - X )
1each 5. XL $8.00 $352.00 TOT-SIZE 1each 5XL-6 XL $8.24 $362.56 TOTSIZE 1each 5XL-6 XL $8.48 $373.12 SOTSIE
(orange) (orange) (orange
TGT-SIZE TGT-SIZE [ 16TS1ZE
(green) (green) | (green)
- . 68.28 - .6: B - X o |
1each 7XL - 8XL $8.37 $368.2 -l 1each 7XL - 8XL $8.62 $379.28 TOTSIZE 1each 7XL - 8XL $8.87 $390.28 | ToTsize
(orange) (orange) | (orange)
M-Xlarge $6.54 $287.76 P M-Xlarge $6.54 $287.76 P M-Xlarge $6.54 $287.76 P
T
2XL - 4XL $6.72 $295.68 P 2XL - 4XL $6.72 $295.68 4 2XL - 4XL $6.72 I $295.68 P
CHARM-TEX T -
5XL-6 XL $6.90 $303.60 , P 5XL-6 XL $6.90 $303.60 P 5XL- 6 XL $6.90 $303.60 P
7XL - 8XL $7.18 $315.92 | P 7XL - 8XL $7.18 $315.92 P 7XL - 8XL $7.18 $315.92 | P
|
pair M-Xlarge $5.77 $253.88 UNTR«(5Z) pair M-Xlarge $5.77 $253.88 UNTR-(SZ) pair M-Xlarge $5.94 $261,36 UNTR-(SZ)
pair 2XL - 4XL $5.97 $262.68 UNTR-(SZ) pair 2XL - 4XL $5.97 $262.68 UNTR(SZ) pair 2XL - 4XL $6.15 $270.60 UNTR-(SZ)
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
pair 5XL- 6 XL $6.11 $268.84 UNTR(52) pair 5XL- 6 XL $6.11 $268.84 UNTR(SZ) pair 5XL-6 XL $6.29 $276.76 UNTR{(SZ)
pair 7XL - 8XL 46.11 $268.84 UNTR+(SZ) pair 7XL - 8XL $6.11 $268.84 UNTR-(SZ) pair 7XL - 8XL $6.29 $276.76 UNTR(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
SOCKS
One Size Fits All
4 Ankle/Crew, 80% Cotton, 20% Man Doz 100 DOZEN
Made Fiber
Color: White
1 1
| |
BOB BARKER 1dozen $5.70 | $570.00 2700-W 1dozen $5.87 $587.00 2700-W 1dozen $6.04 $604.00 7 2700-W
|
|
*Low If *Low If *Low if
rchasing < purchasing < purchasing <
CHARM-TEX . . s : ¥
oA Hao 100 dozen 9554 $54.00 100 dozen 54 D0 100 dozen
SCK/TUBE SCK/TUBE SCK/TUBE
10
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021 - 6/30/2022 7h/2022 - 6/31/2023 21112023 - 6/30/2024
MINIMUM MINIMUM ‘ | MINIMUM ﬁ
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. Mhh__“,nhqm“ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw M.Znﬂmc _uznnﬂuﬂ.mﬂ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. | mxww_znammo _umnooﬂﬂna ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. | mxw_mﬂ",_n_..mmc _.xnn”uccmg
Q QUANTITY QUANTITY _ QUANTITY | |
*Low If *Low If *Low If
purchasing 100 purchasing 100 purchasing 100
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC/ 100 dozen $4.31 $431.00 e 100 dozen $4.31 $431.00 Aot 100 dozen $4.44 $444.00 e
SKTBWHECO SKTBWHECO SKTBWHECO
T T
NYSID *NEED TO GET WAIVER dozen % $9.10 ﬁ $910.00 , SOCKTFoo10 dozen $9.10 $910.00 SOCKTFoo10 dozen $9.10 $910.00 | SOCKTFoot0
NYSC NA NA NA
SHORTS, Boxer, Male
Size: Medium - 8 XL
5 Polyester/Cotton, 3 Panel, Elastic DOz 60 DOZEN
Waistband, Full Cut Leg
Color: White
1dozen M-Xlarge h $12.00 $720.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen M-Xlarge $12.36 $741.60 EBXWH:-size 1dozen M-Xlarge $12.72 $763.20 EBXWH-size
L . 1dozen 2XL - 4XL 7 $12.00 $720.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen 2XL - 4XL $12.36 $741.60 EBXWH-size 1dozen 2XL - 4XL $12.72 $763.20 EBXWH-size
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair/ea -
1dozen 5XL-6 XL 7 $13.20 $792.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen 5XL-6 XL $13.60 $816.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen 5XL-6 XL $13.99 $839.40 EBXWH-size
1dozen 7XL - 8XL 7 $15.00 $900.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen 7XL - 8XL $15.45 $927.00 EBXWH-size 1dozen 7XL - 8XL $15.90 $954.00 EBXWH-size
M-Xlarge 7 $13.90 $834.00 CL/BOXER M-Xlarge $13.90 $834.00 CL/BOXER M-Xlarge $13.90 $834.00 CL/BOXER
CHARM-TEX 2XL - 4XL 7 $14.90 $894.00 CL/BOXER 2XL - 4XL $14.90 $894.00 CL/BOXER 2XL - 4XL $14.90 $894.00 CL/BOXER
5XL- 6 XL 7 $15.90 $954.00 CL/BOXER 5XL-6 XL $15.90 $954.00 CL/BOXER 5XL-6 XL $15.90 $954.00 CL/BOXER
7XL - 8XL 7 $16.90 $1,014.00 CL/BOXER 7XL - 8XL $16.90 $1,014.00 CL/BOXER 7XL - 8XL $16.90 $1,014.00 CL/BOXER
dozen M-Xlarge -$10.41 $624.60 BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen M-Xlarge $10.41 $624.60 BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen M-Xlarge $10.72 $643.20 BXWHBSC{SZ)
ieroRystriy s dozen 2XL - 4XL $11.97 $718.20 BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen 2XL - 4XL $11.97 $718.20 BXWHBSC(S2) dozen 2XL - 4XL. $12.33 $739.80 BXWHBSC{SZ)
dozen 5XL-6 XL $12.41 $744.60 BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen 5XL-6 XL $12.41 $744.60 BXWHBSC-(S2) dozen SXL-6 XL $12.78 $766.80 BXWHBSCA{SZ)
dozen XL - 8XL $13.99 $839.40 BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen 7XL - 8XL $13.99 $839.40  BXWHBSC(SZ) dozen 7XL - 8XL $14.41 $864.60 BXWHBSCA(S2)
5 Dozen M-Xlarge _ $36.50 $2,190.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen M-Xlarge $36.50 $2,190.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen M-Xlarge $36.50 $2,190.00 CO1776**
| ok - ke
Doz 2XL - 4XL 1.00 2,460.00 CO1776° D 2XL - 4XL .00 2,460.00 CO1776° D 2XL - 4XL 1.00 2,460.00 CO1776°
NYSID *NEED TO GET WAIVER 5Dozen 4 4 524 177 5 Dozen 4 $41 $2,4 77 5 Dozen 4 $4 $2,4 77
5 Dozen 5XL-6 XL ' $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen 5XL-6 XL $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen 5XL-6 XL $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776%**
5Dozen 7XL - 8XL “ $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen 7XL - 8XL $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776** 5 Dozen 7XL - 8XL $47.00 $2,820.00 CO1776%**
NYSC NA NA NA
TEE SHIRTS, Crew Neck
Size: Medium - 8 XL
Cotton/Polyester or 100% Pre-Shrunk
b DI
6 Cotton, Taped Neck and Shoulder e 62 DOZEN
Seams
Color: White
*Pricing based on 1 pair/ea dozen *M-Xlarge TN.E ml»ﬁ._tnmﬂ $1,977.84 ZCTSWH:-size dozen *M-Xlarge | $2.07 EA/$24.84/CS| $2,036.88 ZCTSWH-size dozen *M-Xlarge | $2.13 EA/$25.56/CS $2,095.92 | zcTswh-size
B0B BARKER dozen 2XL - 4XL * $23.40/CS 12 [ $1,918.80 671-size dozen 2XL - 4XL $24.10/CS 12 $1,976.20 671-size dozen 2XL - g4XL $24.80 $2,033.60 671-size
dozen 5XL- 6 XL 7 $29.80/CS 12 $2,443.60 671-size dozen 5XL-6 XL $20.87/CS 12 $2,449.34 671-size dozen 5XL- 6 XL $30.74 $2,520.68 671-size
dozen 7XL - 8XL i $36.00/CS 12 $2,952.00 671-size dozen 7XL - 8XL 37.08/CS 12 $3,040.56 671-size dozen 7XL - 8XL $38.16 $3,129.12 671-size
M-Xlarge $22.90 $1,877.80 M-Xlarge $22.90 $1,877.80 M-Xlarge $22.90 $1,877.80
CHARM-TEX 2XL - 4XL ' $25.90 $2,123.80 2XL - 4XL $25.90 $2,123.80 2XL - 4XL $25.90 $2,123.80
5XL- 6 XL 7 $31.90 $2,615.80 5XL-6 XL $31.90 $2,615.80 5XL-6 XL $31.90 $2,615.80
7XL- 8XL ﬁ $39.90 $3,271.80 7XL - 8XL $39.90 $3,271.80 7XL - 8XL $39.90 $3,271.80
dozen M-Xlarge $18.97 $1,555.54 TSWHBSC-(SZ) dozen M-Xlarge $18.97 $1,555.54  TSWHBSC{SZ) dozen M-Xlarge $19.54 $1,602.28 TSWHBSC(SZ)
oo iy dozen 2XL - 4XL $22.44 $1,840.08 TSWHBSC-(S2) dozen 2XL - 4XL $22.44 $1,840.08  TSWHBSC(SZ) dozen 2XL - 4XL $23.11 $1,895.02 TSWHBSC{SZ)
dozen 5XL-6 XL $23.97 $1,965.54 TSWHBSC-(SZ) dozen 5XL-6 XL $23.97 $1,965.54  TSWHBSCA{SZ) dozen 5XL-6 XL $24.69 $2,024.58 TSWHBSC{SZ)
dozen 7XL- 8XL $25.99 $2,131.18 TSWHBSC-(S2Z) dozen 7XL - BXL $25.99 $2,131.18  TSWHBSC{SZ) dozen 7XL - BXL $26.77 $2,195.14 TSWHBSC{SZ)
5 Dozen M-Xlarge i $38.00 $3,116.00 €203782%* 5 Dozen M-Xlarge $38.00 $3,116.00 203782%* 5 Dozen M-Xlarge $38.00 4$3,116.00 203782%*
B - , - s -
NYSID *NEED TO GET WAIVER 5 Dozen 2XL - 4XL 7 $42.00 $3,444.00 203782 5 Dozen 2XL - 4XL $42.00 $3,444.00 203782’ 5 Dozen 2XL - 4XL $42.00 $3,444.00 203782
5 Dozen 5XL- 6 XL 7 $48.00 $3,936.00 "C203782%* 5 Dozen 5XL - 6 XL $48.00 $3,936.00 €203782%* 5 Dozen 5XL-6 XL $48.00 $3,936.00 €203782%*
5 Dozen 7XL - 8XL _ $52.00 | $4,264.00 €203782** 5 Dozen 7XL - 8XL $52.00 | $4,264.00 €203782%* 5 Dozen 7XL - 8XL $52.00 $4,264.00 203782%*
NYSC NA NA
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BID #21-12

INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021 - 6/30/2022 7h/2022 - 6/31/2023 7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024
MINIMUM ‘ MINIMUM m MINIMUM i _ _
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. MM.H_F“,H:U ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw ”.znmmc vxnnwcchna ORDER UNITPRICEPERPKG, | EXTENDED vx%oﬂcmAH ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mwa‘nammc , vxmuﬂﬂnq
Q QUANTITY QUANTITY W PRICE QUANTITY |
SWEATSHIRTS, Hooded
Size: Medium - 8 XL
Hood is 1-Ply Material w/ NO
Drawstrings, Cuffs and Waistbands
to be cover seamed and ribbed,
7 Heavy Weight Material, 50% EA 70 EACH
Cotton/50% Polyester,
JCCF to be imprinted in 3" Black
Letters on Back
Color: Gray
SSGYH-size M-Xlarge $8.75 $612.50 SSGYH-size SSGYH-size M-Xlarge $10.04 $702.80 SSGYH-size SSGYH-size M-Xlarge $10.34 $723.80 SSGYH-size
2XL - 4XL
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pairjea SSGYH-size NO XL $11.50 $805.00 SSGYH-size SSGYH-size 2XL - 4XL $11.85 $820.50 SSGYH-size SSGYH-size 2XL - 4XL $12.19 $853.30 SSGYH-size
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NOBID NO BID
M-Xlarge m $10.90 $763.00 M-Xlarge $10.90 ﬂ $763.00 _ M-Xlarge $10.98 _ $768.60
v XL - 4XL $11.90 $833.00 3XL ONLY 2XL - 4XL $11.90 $833.00 3XL ONLY 2XL - 4XL. $11.90 $833.00 3XL ONLY
5XL-6 XL $12.90 $903.00 5XL-6 XL $12.90 $903.00 5XL-6 XL $12.90 $903.00 ,
7XL - 8XL $13.90 $973.00 7XL - 8XL $13.90 $973.00 7XL - 8XL $13.90 $973.00
| each M-Xlarge $12.74 $891.80 SSHZSASH-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $12.74 $891.80 SSHZSASH-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $13.12 $918.40 SSHZSASH-(SZ)
| h 2XL - 4XL . X SSHZSASH-(SZ - X ,397. SSHZSASH-(SZ, - 5 ,439. SSHZSASH-(SZ;
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC| eac 4 $19.97 $1,397.90 (52) each 2XL - 4XL $19.97 $1,397.90 (52) each 2XL - 4XL $20.57 $1,439.90 (S2),
each 5XL- 6 XL $24.97 $1,747.90 SSHZSASH-(SZ) each 5XL-6 XL $24.97 $1,747.90 SSHZSASH-(SZ) each 5XL-6 XL $25.72 $1,800.40 SSHZSASH-(SZ)
each 7XL- 8XL $29.97 $2,097.90 SSHZSASH-(SZ) each 7XL - 8XL $29.97 $2,097.90 | SSHZSASH-(SZ) each 7XL - 8XL $30.87 $2,160.90 SSHZSASH-(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
BRAS, Sport, Ladies
Size:32-54
8 EA 8
Two-Ply, Lycra/Cotton 228 EACH
Color: White '
BOB BARKER Sold by dozen 1dozen $18.00 ($1.50 EA) $342.00 EBASPLS-size 1dozen $18.54 (41,55 EA) $352.26 EBASPLSsize 1dozen $19.08 ?.w.w EA) $362.52 EBASPLS-size
CHARM-TEX $1.99 $453.72 CL/SBRA $1.99 $453.72 CL/SBRA $1.99 $453.72 CL/SBRA
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC dozen $1.55 $353.40 SBWH-(S2) dozen $1.55 $353.40 SBWH-(SZ) dozen $1.60 $364.80 SBWH-(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
PANTIES, Ladies
Size:5-18
Lightweight Cotton or Cotton Blend,
DO
9 Elastic Leg Brief, Double Panel z 58 DOZEN
Crotch
Color: White
T
A : 1dozen Size 5-10 $7.75 $449.50 ELBLCTN-size 1dozen Size 5-10 $7.98 $462.84 4 ELBLCTN-size 1dozen Size 5-10 $8.22 $476.76 ﬁ ELBLCTN-size
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair/ea
1dozen Size 1118 $8.75 $507.50 ELBLCTN-size 1dozen Size 1118 $9.01 $522.58 ELBLCTN-size 1dozen Size 11118 $9.28 $538.24 ELBLCTN-size
Size 5-10 $7.90 $458.20 CL/PANT Size 5-10 $7.90 $458.20 CL/PANT Size 5-10 $7.90 $458.20 CL/PANT
CHARNITEX 5 7-9 45 L 5 79 5
Size 1118 $9.90 $574.20 Size 11-18 $9.90 $574.20 Size 11-18 $9.90 $574.20
dozen Size 510 7.1 $412.38 PNTYWH-(SZ) dozen Size 510 $7.11 $412.38 PNTYWHA{(SZ dozen Size 5-10 .32 .56 PNTYWH-(SZ,
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC 2 3 &2 5 % 412.3 H{52) ze 51 473 $424.5 (S2)
dozen Size 11-18 $9.24 $535.92 PNTYWH-(SZ) dozen Size 1118 $9.24 $535.92 PNTYWH-+(SZ) dozen Size 1118 $9.52 $552.16 _ PNTYWH-(SZ)
NYSID NOBID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES

BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021- 6/30/2022 7h/2022 - 6/31/2023 7112023 - 6/30/2024
- - . _ . . _ _— 4 S _ -
MINIMUM MINIMUM MINIMUM |
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. MM_H_FW”:W ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw ”_zn_mmo | nxmuucﬂnq ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mx_qu”_znmmo vxnnmvccﬂﬂ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxwmﬂ‘n_mmc M vxnn“vco”nq
Q QUANTITY | | QUANTITY QUANTITY |
JUMPSUITS, No Velcro, No Pockets,
Heavy Duty Snaps, 65% Polyester/35%
Cotton,
° JCCF to be imprinted on Back w/ 3" e 24 EACH
Black Letters
Color: Orange
6 eaches MXlarge  $72.12 ($12.02 EA) $288.48 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches M-Xlarge $74.28 ($12.37 EA) $297.12 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches M-Xlarge  $76.45 ($12.74 EA) $305.80 JZOJSNPsize
6 eaches 2XL-4XL  $76.02 (312,67 EA) $304.08 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches 2XL-4XL  §78.30 (513.05 EA) 431320 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches 2XL-4XL  $80.58 ($13.43 EA) 432232 JZOJSNP-size
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based oncs 6
6 eaches 5XL-6 XL  $90.00 $15.00 EA) $360.00 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches 5XL-6 XL $92.70 ($15.46) $370.80 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches 5XL-6XL  $95.40($15.90 EA) $381.60 JZOJSNP-size
6 eaches “7XL-8XL  $90.00 ($15.00 EA $360.00 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches XL - 8XL $92.70 ($15.46) $370.80 JZOJSNP-size 6 eaches JXL-8XL  $95.40 ($15.90 EA) $381.60 JZOJSNP-size
M-Xlarge $14.54 $348.96 M-Xlarge $14.54 $348.96 M-Xlarge $14.54 $348.96
2XL - 4XL $15.54 $372.96 2XL - 4XL $15.54 $372.96 2XL - 4XL $15.54 $372.96
CHARM-TEX
5XL-6 XL $16.54 $396.96 5XL-6 XL $16.54 $396.96 5XL-6 XL $16.54 $396.96
7XL - 8XL $17.54 $420.96 7XL - 8XL $17.54 $420.96 7XL - 8XL $17.54 $420.96 |
each M-Xlarge $14.99 $359.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $14.99 $359.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each M-Xlarge $15.44 | $370.56 UNJSOR-(SZ)
| |
T T
each 2XL - 4XL $15.99 $383.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 2XL - XL $15.99 $383.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 2XL - 4XL $16.47 $395.28 UNJSOR-(SZ)
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC 1
| each 5XL- 6 XL $16.99 $407.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 5XL-6 XL $16.99 $407.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 5XL-6 XL $17.50 $420.00 UNJSOR-(SZ)
. each 7XL - 8XL $18.24 $437.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 7XL - 8XL $18.24 $437.76 UNJSOR-(SZ) each 7XL - 8XL $18.79 $450.96 UNJSOR-(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
SWI -
“ EATSHIRTS, #SSGY - Gray, EA 135 EACH
Crewnectk pullover, no pocket
T T
1each Size: 5XL 7 $6.65 7 $897.75 7 SSGY-5XL 1each Size: 5XL 7 $6.85 $924.75 SSGY-5XL 1each Size: 5XL 7 $7.05 A $951.75 7 SSGY-5XL
1each Size: 6XL. $6.65 $897.75 SSGY-6XL. 1each Size: 6XL. $6.85 $924.75 SSGY-6XL 1each Size: 6XL. $7.05 $951.75 SSGY-6XL.
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair/ea X
Size: 7XL * NO BID _ NO BID _ Size: 7XL _ NO BID $0.00 Size: 7XL * NO BID 7 $0.00 _
1each Size: 8XL $10.47 $1,413.45 SSGY-8XL 1each Size: 8XL $10.78 $1,455.30 SSGY-8XL 1each Size: 8XL $11.90 $1,498.50 SSGY-8XL
1each Size: 10XL $10.91 $1,472.85 SSGY-10XL 1each Size: 10XL 41124 $1,517.40 SSGY-10XL 1each Size: 10XL 41156 $1,560.60 SSGY-10XL
Size: 5XL $9.90 $1,336.50 Size: 5XL $9.90 $1,336.50 Size: 5XL $9.90 $1,336.50
Size: 6XL m_o“mo $1,471.50 Size: 6XL $10.90 $1,471.50 Size: 6XL $10.90 $1,471.50
M-T|
SHARM TR Size: 7XL $11.90 $1,606.50 Size: 7XL $11.90 $1,606.50 Size: 7XL $11.90 $1,606.50
Size: 8XL $11.90 i $1,606.50 _ * Size: 8XL H $11.90 $1,606.50 Size: 8XL j $11.90 $1,606.50
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BID #21-12

BID TABULATION

INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021- 6/30/2022 7/1/2022 - 6/31/2023 7112023 - 6/30/2024
MINIMUM MINIMUM | MINIMUM
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. MM_H_FB\”HW ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw”_znmmc vmnﬂocc%q ORDER | UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxwmﬂ,_nmmc 1mnmvﬂﬂnq ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxwmﬂmmc vauoo.an
Q QUANTITY QUANTITY | QUANTITY
Size: 10XL $12.90 $1,741.50 Size: 10XL 7 $12.90 $1,741.50 Size: 10XL | $12.90 $1,741.50
each Size: 5XL $6.11 $824.85 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 5XL $6.11 $824.85 SSGY-(5Z) each Size: 5XL $6.29 $849.15 SSGY-(S7)
each Size: 6XL $7.11 $959.85 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 6XL $7.11 $959.85 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 6XL M $7.32 $988.20 SSGY-(SZ)
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC each Size: 7XL $11.97 $1,615.95 SSGY~(SZ) each Size: 7XL $11.97 $1,615.95 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 7XL , $12.33 $1,664.55 SSGY-(S2)
each Size: 8XL $11.97 $1,615.95 SSGY~(SZ) each Size: 8XL | $11.97 $1,615.95 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 8XL $12.33 $1,664.55 SSGY-(SZ)
each Size: 10XL $13.97 $1,885.95 |  SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 10XL ~ $13.97 $1,885.95 SSGY-(SZ) each Size: 10XL $14.39 $1,942.65 SSGY-(SZ)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
SHOES, #F/STEP - Step in, black,
12 |slip resistant, odor resistant, EA 28 EACH
waterproof, one piece
1 pair Size: 2XI $3.05 $85.40 FEVS35-bk-2XL 1pair Size: 2XI $3.14 $87.92 FEVS35-bk-2XL 1pair Size: 2XI 43.23 $90.44 FEVS35-bk-2XL
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair/ea
1 pair Size: 3XL $3.05 $85.40 FEVS35-bk-3XL 1 pair Size: 3XL $3.14 $87.92 FEVS35-bk-3XL 1 pair Size: 3XL $3.23 $90.44 FEVS35-bk-3XL
1
Size: 2XI  {$49.90 ($4.16 m\cw $116.48 Size: 2XI $49.90 ($4.16 EA) $116.48 Size: 2XI $49.90 ($4.16 EA) $116.48
CHARM-TEX T -
Size: 3XL  |$49.90 ($4.16 EA)| $116.48 Size: 3XL | $49.90 ($4.16 EA) $116.48 Size:3XL | $49.90 ($4.16 EA) $116.48
each Size: 2XI $3.49 $97.72 SHEVDSB-2XL each Size: 2XI $3.49 $97.72 SHEVDSB-2XL each Size: 2XI $3.59 $100.52 SHEVDSB-2XL
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
each Size: 3XL $3.49 | $97.72 SHEVDSB-3XL each Size: 3XL $3.49 $97.72 SHEVDSB-3XL each ize: 3XL $3.59 $100.52 SHEVDSB-3XL
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
COATS, WORK - Durable, Heavy | 175
; Weight FabricE, 100% Polyester EA (TOTAL
3 shrink-resistant, Blanket Linings, DIFFERENT
Orange SIZES)
1each Size: 38-40 $17.00 $2,975.00 | 652-OR-3840 1each Size: 38-40 $17.51 $3,064.25 652-OR-3840 1each Size: 38-40 _ $18.02 $3,153.50 _ 652-OR-3840
1each Size: 42-44 $17.00 $2,975.00 652-OR-4244 1each Size: 42-44 $17.51 $3,064.25 652-0R-4244 1each Size: 42-44 _ $18.02 $3,153.50 652-OR-4244
1each Size: 46-48 $18.00 $3,150.00 652-OR-4648 1each Size: 46-48 $18.54 $3,244.50 652-OR-4648 1each Size: 46-48 | $19.08 $3,339.00 652-0R-4648
1each Size: 50-52 $18.00 $3,150.00 652-OR-5052 1each Size: 50-52 $18.54 $3,244.50 652-OR-5052 1each Size: 50-52 | $19.08 $3,339.00 652-OR-5052
BOB BARKER| *Pricing based on 1 pair/ea 1each Size: 54-56 $18.00 $3,150.00 652-OR-5456 1each Size: 54-56 $18.54 $3,244.50 | 652-OR-5456 1each Size: 54-56 | $19.08 $3,339.00 652-OR-5456
1each Size: 58-60 $18.00 $3,150.00 652-0R-5860 1each Size: 58-60 $18.54 $3,244.50 652-0R-5860 1each Size: 58-60 $19.08 $3,339.00 652-0R-5860
1each Size: 66-68 $20.00 $3,500.00 652-OR-6668 1each Size: 66-68 $20.60 $3,605.00 652-OR-6668 1each Size: 66-68 $26.20 $4,585.00 652-OR-6668
Size: 70-72 NO BID NO BID Size: 70-72 NO BID $0.00 Size: 70-72 NO BID $0.00
Size: 74-76 NO BID NO BID Size: 74-76 NO BID $0.00 Size: 74-76 NO BID $0.00
Size: 38-40 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 38-40 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 38-40 $15.90 $2,782.50
Size: 42-44 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 42-44 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 42-44 $15.90 4$2,782.50
Size: 46-48 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 46-48 $15.90 $2,782.50 Size: 46-48 $15.90 $2,782.50
| . T T T
€:50-52 _ $15.90 | $2,782.50 * Size:50-52 | $15.90 “ $2,782.50 Size: 50-52 $15.90 “ $2,782.50
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

7/1/2021 - 6/30/2022 7h1[2022 - 6/31/2023 7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024
T i T
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. MMN_FB\HMW z.ﬁ_uﬂczmﬂz UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxwmn,_nmmu vx.nn“uccﬂnq g_cﬂ_w\_mﬂz | UNITPRICE PER PKG. mwa,_n_Mmc | Enﬂooﬂﬂ zﬁ_ﬂ_ﬁﬁﬂz | UNITPRICE PER PKG. mxwmn‘nmmu nxnw.c%mﬁ
QUANTITY QUANTITY | [ QUANTITY
CHARM-TEX Size: 54-56 $16.90 $2,957.50 Size: 54-56 $16.90 $2,957.50 Size: 54-56 $16.90 $2,957.50
Size: 58-60 $16.90 $2,957.50 Size: 58-60 $16.90 $2,957.50 Size: 58-60 $16.90 $2,957.50
Size: 66-68 $17.90 $3,132.50 Size: 66-68 $17.90 $3,132.50 Size: 66-68 $17.90 $3,132.50
Size: 70-72 $18.90 $3,307.50 Size: 70-72 $18.90 $3,307.50 Size: 70-72 $18.90 $3,307.50
Size: 74-76 $18.90 $3,307.50 Size: 74-76 $18.90 $3,307.50 Size: 74-76 $18.90 $3,307.50
each Size: 38-40 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 38-40 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR+(SZ) each Size: 38-40 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(SZ)
each Size: 42-44 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 42-44 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR+(SZ) each Size: 42-44 $16.45 | $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(SZ)
each Size: 46-48 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 46-48 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{(SZ) each Size: 46-48 $16.45 ; $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(SZ)
each Size: 50-52 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 50-52 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{52) each Size: 50-52 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(SZ)
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC each Size: 54-56 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR(S2) each Size: 54-56 $15.97 $2,79475  JKT-OR{SZ) each Size: 54-56 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-:OR{(SZ)
each Size: 58-60 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 58-60 415.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{(SZ) each Size: 58-60 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR(SZ)
each Size: 66-68 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR-(SZ) each Size: 66-68 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{SZ) each Size: 66-68 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(SZ)
each Size: 70-72 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR(52) each Size: 70-72 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{SZ) each Size: 70-72 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR(SZ)
each Size: 74-76 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR<(SZ) each Size: 74-76 $15.97 $2,794.75 JKT-OR{52) each Size: 74-76 $16.45 $2,878.75 JKT-OR-(52)
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
CAPS, BEANIE - Warm, high-bulk
w [ s poss
Lip, One Size Fits All
BOB BARKER NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHARM-TEX $12.90 $193.50 $12.90 $193.50 $12.90 $193.50
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC dozen | $12.95 | s19425 | wcap dozen i $12.95 [ $194.25 WCAP dozen | | $13.34 | $20010 | wcAP
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
L | | L S0.00 L L S0.00
INMATE SUPPLIES
15 |SOAP, Bar, Unwrapped, .5 0z. 1,000/CASE 9 CASES
BOB BARKER 1case $57.00 $s13.00 | urc tcase | $58.71 | 52839 | U-C 1case | $60.42 | 454398 _ -C
CHARM-TEX $33.90 $305.10 $33.90 $305.10 $33.90 $305.10
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $109.94 | s989.46 | SPos ase | $109.94 | 5989.46 * SPos case , $113.24 | w0906 | spos
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
16 |SOAP, Bar, Unwrapped, 1.5 0z. 500/CASE 2 CASES
BOB BARKER 1case $74.00 ) | su4Bo0 | TussC 1case $76.22 | s15204 | TUsC 1case $78.44 | sses8 | Tuisc
CHARM-TEX $45.90 $91.80 $45.90 $91.80 $45.90 $91.80
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC 1case $129.98 i $259.96 ﬁ SP15 1case $129.98 i $259.96 SP15 1case $133.88 _ $267.76 SP15
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
SANITARY NAPKINS, Maxi-thins,
T et | st | qats
w/Adhesive Strip
BOB BARKER 1case $24.00 $96.00 500IM-C 1case $24.72 $98.88 500IM-C 1case $25.44 $101.76 500IM-C
CHARM-TEX $41.90 | s67.60 | , ﬂ $41.90 | s167.60 $41.90 $167.60 |
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $57.90 | $231.60 | SU2s0lM case _ $57.90 ‘ $231.60 SU250IM case “ $59.64 $238.56 Su250IM
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
15
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

71112021 - 6/30/202 71112022 - 6/31/2023 7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024
i
MINIMUM | MINIMUM 7 MINIMUM
ITEM # DESCRIPTION PER PKG. Mﬂrﬂwﬁ“ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw M_znmmc EMHHQ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mxw”ﬂ.nmmo ﬁ vxnnwcccmﬂ ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. mwa,_ano vxmvouﬂnq
Q QUANTITY QUANTITY | | QUANTITY I
TAMPONS, Regular Absorbancy, Ind.
8 CAS
: Wrapped, Cardboard Applicator 5O0/CASE 4 =
BOB BARKER 1case $49.11 $196.44 TPX500 1case $50.58 $202.32 TPX500 1case $52.06 $208.24 TPX500
CHARM-TEX NO BID NO BID NO BID
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $64.44 N $257.76 SUTMPR case $64.44 $257.76 SUTMPR case $66.37 m $265.48 SUTMPR
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
RAZORS, Disposable, Single Blade,
19  |Stainless Steel w/Clear, Removable 100/CASE 4 CASES
Safety Cap
BOB BARKER *Sold 600/cs 1case $32.88 ($.0548 EA) | 288 | Reoo 1case | $33.87 ($.0565 EA) | 4387 | Reoo 1case $34.85 ($.0581 EA) | 485 | Reoo
CHARM-TEX $5.36 ($.0536 EA) $21.44 45.36 ($.0536 EA) $21.44 45.36 (4.0536 EA) $21.44
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $9.50 ($.0950 EA) | $3800 | SURAZIC case $9.50 ($.0950 EA) | 43800 SURAZ1C case $9.79 (0979 EA) | $3914 | SURAZIC
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
TOOTHPASTE, Fluoride, .85 oz.
20 [Maximum Security (See-Thru 144/CASE 9 CASES
Packaging)
T T T f
BOB BARKER 1case $28.00 $252.00 MST85 1case i $28.84 | $259.56 MST85 1case $29.68 | $267.12 4 MST85
| |
CHARM-TEX $19.90 $179.10 H/CGTPo85 _ $19.90 ﬁ $179.10 H/CGTPo85 $19.90 | $179.10 H/CGTPo85
|
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $18.50 $166.50 SURTPo85 case $18.50 $166.50 SURTP085 case $19.06 $171.54 SURTP085
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
TOOTHBRUSHES, Shorty, 3-1/4",
21 Nylon Bristle, Individually sealed in 144/CASE 48 CASES
clear bags
BOB BARKER 1case $4.25 $204.00 BBST25-8 1case $4.38 $210.24 BBST25-B 1case $4.51 $216.48 BBST25-B
CHARM-TEX $5.18 w $248.64 H/TB20 $5.18 w $248.64 7 H/TB20 $5.18 w $248.64 | H/TB20
T
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $6.10 ” $292.80 SUTB21 case $6.10 | $292.80 7 SUTB21 case $6.28 W $301.44 SUTB21
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
PERSONAL CARE KIT
Includes, 3-1/4” Toothbrush,
42 Toothpaste, Comb, Shave, Shower 144/CASE 7 CASES
and Shampoo Products
BOB BARKER 1case $72.00 $504.00 KIT 1case $74.88 $524.16 KIT 1case $76.32 4534.24 KIT
CHARM-TEX $80.64 7 $564.48 KIT/JEFFERSON | $80.64 $564.48 7 KIT/JEFFERSON $80.64 $564.48 KIT/JEFFERSON|
1 1 1
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $112.32 $786.24 TBD case | $112.32 $786.24 | T8D case $115.69 , $809.83 TBD
1 1
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
WASHCLOTHS, White, 100%
23 Cotton/Terry,12” x 12 boz 70 DOZEN
BOB BARKER 1dozen $2.25 | $157.50 wCi212 1dozen | $2.32 $162.40 | wWCi1212 1dozen $2.39 $167.30 WC1212
i
CHARM-TEX $1.99 $139.30 wci1212J.75E $1.99 $139.30 4 wci212).75E H, $1.99 $139.30 | wc212).75E
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC! dozen $1.92 $134.40 WCWH2112 dozen $1.92 $134.40 WCWH2112 dozen $1.98 $138.60 WCWH2112
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

ITEM #

25

26

27

30

DESCRIPTION

NYSID
NYSC
TOWELS, 20" x 40", 100%

Cotton/Terry, Medium Weight,
White

BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID

NYSC

SHAMPOO, All-one

BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX|
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID

NYSC
PUMP, Gallon for above
BOB BARKER

CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC
SHOWER CURTAIN, Translucent,
Hookless, 36" x 77", 8.5 0z, 2-ply
Vinvl, Color: Milky-white
BOB BARKER

CHARM-TEX

VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC
SHOWER CURTAIN, 36" X 82".
Velcro Loops, Weighted, Clear View
Top
BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC

FINGERNAIL CLIPPERS, NO FILE, All
Metal, 2" length

BOB BARKER

CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC
TOENAIL CLIPPERS, NO FILE, nickel
plated steel with chrome finish,
3.25" length

BOB BARKER

CHARM-TEX

PER PKG.

GAL

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL QTY

34 DOZEN

3 GALLON

Sold by case of 4 gallons

24/CASE

12/CASE

12 EACH

15 EACH

1CASE

2 CASES

7112021 - 6/30/2022 7h/2022 - 6/31/2023
I I
MINIMUM i | MINIMUM
ORDER UNITPRICEPERPKG, | EXTENDED | PRODUCT ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. V EXTENDED | FRODUCT
| PRICE CODE PRICE CODE
QUANTITY | QUANTITY | | |
NOBID NO BID
NA NA
1dozen $15.25 $518.50 BT2040 1dozen $15.71 $534.14 BT2040
$11.90 | $404.60 M BT2040J5.5E $11.90 $404.60 BT2040J5.5E
dozen $10.97 $372.98 BTWH2040 dozen $10.97 $372.98 BTWH2040
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
1case $69.25 ($17.31/GAL) $69.25 _ MS40G-AB 1case $71.33 ($17.83/GAL) $71.33 W MS40G-AB
$9.72 $29.16 H/CTSSB128 $9.72 $29.16 H/CTSSB128
gallon $12.50 $37.50 SUSBW128 gallon $12.50 $37.50 SUSBW128
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
NO BID NO BID
$4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
each $5.00 “ $5.00 W SUPMP each 7 $5.00 $5.00 * SUPMP
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
m 7
1each $12.50 $150.00 TSC36 $12.88 $154.56
NO BID NO BID
12 each §16.99 $203.88 |  TBD _ $16.99 $203.88 |  TBD
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
, | | |
L 1 ,i
NO BID NO BID
$9.90 $148.50 $9.90 : 4148.50
each $22.99 | 34485 | TBD each | $22.99 | 434085 8D
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
|
|
,V
1case $8.05 $8.05 FNC24 1case $8.29 $8.29 FNC24
$8.90 $8.90 $8.90 $8.90
case $6.97 $6.97 FNC3275 case $6.97 $6.97 FNC3275
NO BID NO BID
NA NA
| I I
| |
1case 46.75 $13.50 TNC12 1case $6.95 $13.90 TNC12
$8.90 W $17.80 M $8.90 7_ $17.80

MINIMUM
ORDER
QUANTITY

1dozen

dozen

1case

each

each

1case

case

1case

71112023 - 6/30/2024

UNIT PRICE PER PKG.

$16.17
$11.90
$11.30

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

$73-41($18.35/GAL)

$9.72
$12.88

$4.00
$5.15

$13.25

$17.50

$9.90
$23.68

$8.53

$8.90
4748

NO BID
NA

NO BID

NO BID
NA

NO BID

NO BID
NA

NO BID

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

$7.16

$8.90

EXTENDED
PRICE

$549.78
$404.60
$384.20

$73.41
$29.16
$38.64

$4.00
$5.00

$159.00

$210.00

$148.50
$355.20

$8.53

$8.90
$7.48

$14.32

$17.80

|
|
I

|
1

L

PRODUCT
CODE

BT2040
BT2040J5.5E
BTWH2040

MS40G-AB
H/CTSSB128
SUSBW128

SUPMP

TBD

FNC24

FNC3275

TNC12

17
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES

BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

ITEM #

32

33

34

35

36

DESCRIPTION

VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID

NYSC

PILLOW CASES, White, Poly Cotton
Blend, Fits Standard size 20" x 26"
BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC
SHEETS, Flat, White, 66" x 104", 50%
Polvester/50% Cotton
BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC
BLANKETS, Fire Resistant, 4#, 9o%
Woven Wool,
66" x 90"

BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID

NYSC

BLANKETS, Standard, 66" x 90",
Thermal, 100% Cotton, White
BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID
NYSC

MATTRESS, 25" X 75" X

Antibacterial, stain resistent, flame
resistent, vinvl cover
BOB BARKER!
CHARM-TEX

VICTORY SUPPLY LLC

NYSID
NYSC

MATTRESS, 30" x 75" x 4", Cotton
Core, PVC cover treated w/Flame
Retardant, Must meet or exceed
California Codes 117 and 129 for
flammability. In ually Wrapped
for Shipping

BOB BARKER
CHARM-TEX
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC
NYSID

NYSC

PER PKG.

DOz

Doz

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL QTY

50 DOZEN

24 DOZEN

72 EACH

73 EACH

32 EACH

36 EACH

MINIMUM
ORDER
QUANTITY

case

1dozen

dozen

1dozen

dozen

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

7112021 - 6/30/2022

UNIT PRICE PER PKG.

$6.97
NOBID
NA
$8.25
$7.90
$10.99
NO BID
NA
$43:30 i
$36.90 ﬁ
$31.99
NO BID
NA
$10.25 v
$7.90
|
$8.97 _
NO BID
NA
$6.65 |
$6.18 |
$5.44
NO BID
NA
$34.00
$39.90
$58.20
NO BID
NA
$52.50 |
$59.90
$62.11
$47.00
NA

EXTENDED
PRICE

$13.94

$412.50
$395.00
$549.50

$1,039.20
$885.60
$767.76

$738.00
$568.80

$645.84

$485.45
$451.14
$397.12

$1,088.00
$1,276.80

$1,862.40

$1,890.00
$2,156.40
$2,235.96
$1,692.00

T
|
|

|

|

PRODUCT
CODE

TNC3299

PC4234
4234W130
PCWH2026

SH66104L

SHT661042

WB6690GY
POMONAgO

BLW669080

EGTB
THERMAL20
LNBLSFWHECO

PIM25754

MAGSS25754

COT30754

8D

MINIMUM
ORDER
QUANTITY

case

1dozen

dozen

1dozen

dozen

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

2h[2022

- 6/31,

UNIT PRICE PER PKG.

$6.97

$8.50
$7.90
$10.99

$44.60
$36.90
$31.99

$10.56
$7.90
$8.97

$6.85
$6.18
$5.44

$35.02
$39.90

$58.20

$54.08
$59.90
$62.11

$47.00

NO BID

NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID

NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

NA

2

)2

3

EXTENDED
PRICE

$13.94

$425.00
$395.00
$549.50

$1,070.40
$885.60
$767.76

$760.32
$568.80

$645.84

$500.05
$451.14
$397.12

$1,120.64
$1,276.80

$1,862.40

$1,946.88
$2,156.40
$2,235.96

41,692.00

PRODUCT
CODE

TNC3299

PC4234
4234W130
PCWH2026

SH66104L

SHT661042

7 WB6690GY
POMONAgo

7 BLW669080

[ et
| THERMAL20
LNBLSFWHECO

PIM25754

| MAGSS25754

COT30754

TBD

MINIMUM
ORDER
QUANTITY

case

1dozen

dozen

1dozen

dozen

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

1each

each

7/1/2023 - 6/30/2024

UNIT PRICE PER PKG.

$8.75
$7.90
$11.32

$45.90
$36.90
$32.95

$10.87
$7.90
$9.24

$7.05
$6.18
$5.60

$36.04
$39.90
$59.95

$55.65
$59.90
$63.97
$47.00

$7.18

NO BID

NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID

NA

NO BID
NA

NO BID
NA

NA

EXTENDED

PRICE

$14.36

$437.50
$395.00
$566.00

$1,101.60
$885.60
$790.80

$782.64
$568.80
$665.28

$514.65
$451.14
$408.80

$1,153.28
$1,276.80

$1,918.40

$2,003.40
$2,156.40
$2,302.92

4$1,692.00

PRODUCT
CODE

TNC3299

PC4234
4234W130
PCWH2026

SH66104L

7
_

SHT661042

| WB6690GY
POMONAgO

BLW669080

EGTB
| THERMAL20
LNBLSFWHECO)

PIM25754
_

_ MAGSS25754

CoT30754

TBD

18
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BID #21-12
INMATE APPAREL AND SUPPLIES
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

2/1/2021 - 6/30/2022 7/1/2022 - 6/31/2023 7112023 - 6/30/2024
I | I |
MINIMUM i | MINIMUM | MINIMUM
EXTENDED PRODUCT
— DESCRIPTION PER PKG. MMA_F”\S_.;W ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. | mxw”"‘n_mmu _ vx%%chg ORDER UNIT PRICE PER PKG. — mxwwﬂ‘nmmc vmnoo_wmﬁ ORDER | UNITPRICEPERPKG. | PTERD ot
NUALQ QUANTITY | _ QUANTITY | QUANTITY | ,
3 zS.jxmmm COVER, Vinyl, Flame A 5 EACH
| Resistant, 30"x75'"x4", Dark Green
BOB BARKER 1each $15.00 7 $75.00 7 VMC30724 1each $15.45 i $77:25 " VMC30724 1each $15.90 i $79.50 | VMC30724
CHARM-TEX $13.90 $69.50 $13.90 $69.50 $13.90 16950 .
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC each $18.99 | $94.95 | MTCVRV30754 each $18.99 | $9495 | MTCVRV30754 each $19:56 | $97.80 | MTCVRV30754
NYSID NO BID NO BID ~ NOBID
NYSC NA NA NA )
_ m | * * , * W * W l
DETERGENT, DISINFECTANT,
DEODORIZER, fights mildew,
38 |bacteria, viruses, HIV-1, packets 180/CASE 10 CASES
make up to 1 gallon of cleaning
solution
BOB BARKER 1case $45.00 $450.00 90650 1case $46.35 $463.50 90650 1case _ $47.70 $477.00 90650
CHARM-TEX NO BID _ $0.00 NO BID “ $0.00 NO BID
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $49.94 $499.40 8D case $49.94 v $499.40 TBD case _ $51.44 ,W $514.40 TBD
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
PENS, Maximum Security, Clear Soft
144/CASE CASES
3 Vinyl, Flexible, 4" long, Black Ink 44/ 3
BOB BARKER 1case $12.96 $38.88 MSBP 1case $13.35 $40.05 MSBP 1case $13.74 $41.22 MsBP
CHARM-TEX $14.90 | 4470 $14.90 | 54470 $14.90 | saa70 |
VICTORY SUPPLY LLC case $19.44 $58.32 SUFPBK case $19.44 _ $58.32 SUFPBK case $20.02 | $60.06 _ SUFPBK
NYSID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NYSC NA NA NA
T T
COMMENTS: | |
DEVIATIONS:
) -
| J/ | | | |
ALLDATAIS vxm_.__s_z%.w»zo DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. | | |
T
THIS DATA SHOULD-NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. |
THIS BID TABUKATION DOES NOTIMRLY.AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED. | |
L prey g \ . | |
7 XSt — 1B | | |
- = i i i i
7/ PURCHASING /oATE J | | 4 ,
A4 ] | | |
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